
Attachment "A"

Bid Schedule for Washoe County Requirements

Washoe County 

Bid No. 3078-19  

Bid 

Item 

No. Description Color

Product 

#

Unit of 

Purchase

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  Unit Price  

 Extended 

Total 

 Unit 

Price  

Alternative 

offering  Unit Price 

 Extended 

Total 

1. Index Paper, 125 Pound no bid -               

24 x 36" Britewhite Case 30 -               -             

500 sheets/case

Earthchoice Tag  

No Substitutes

2. Index Paper, 90 Pound

8.5 x 14" White Case 10 no bid -               -             

2000 sheets/case  

Exact/Neenha

No Substitutes

3. Index Paper, 110 Pound Springhill $56.00/cs$5,600.00$5,600.00

8.5 x 11" Various Case 100 -               -             

2000 sheets/case

Exact/Neenha

No Substitutes

4. Index Paper, 110 Pound White Case 10 no bid -               -             

8 1/2" x 14"

2000 sheets/case

Exact/Neenha

No Substitutes

5. Index Paper, 90 Pound Springhill $52.50/cs 262.50       

11" x 17" Britewhite Case 5 -               -             

500 sheets/case

Exact/Neenha

No Substitutes

6. Index Paper, 140 Pound no bid
22 (or 22.5, 23, 25") X 30.5" 

(or 35")  White Case 15 -               -             

Lot 1 

Index Paper
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500 sheets/case

Various 

Colors

Exact/Neenha

No Substitutes

8. Bond Paper, 20 pound Hammermill $55.00/cs $13,200

8-1/2" x 11" Various Case 240 -               -             

5000 sheets/case Colors

9. Bond Paper, 20 Pound Hammermill $69.00/cs $690.00

8-1/4" x 14" Various Case 10 -               -             

5000 sheets/case Colors

10. Bond Paper, 20 Pound Hammermill $57.50/cs $2,875.00

11" x 17" Various Case 50 -               -             

2500 sheets/case Colors

11. Astrobrights, Text Paper, 60 Pound

8-1/2" x 11" Various Ream 50 $10.00/rm $500.00 -             

Smooth Finish Colors

500 sheets/ream

12. Astrobrights, Text Paper, 60 Pound no bid -               

8-1/2" x 14" Various Ream 10 -               -             

Smooth Finish Colors

500 sheets/ream

13. Astrobrights, Text Paper, 60 Pound no bid -               

11" x 17" Various

Smooth Finish Colors Ream 10 -               -             

500 sheets/ream

Lot 3

  Astrobrights Colored Paper

Lot 2

                           Colored Bond Paper - Premium #4 Sulphite, Long Grain, 86 Brightness
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14. Astrobrights, Cover paper, 65 Pound $10.00/rm $100.00

8-1/2" x 11" Various Ream 10 -               -             

Smooth Finish Colors

250 sheets/ream

15. Bond, 20 Pound

8-1/2" x 11" White Ream 120 $13.89/rm $1,666.80 -             

Capitol Bond, Watermarked

Cockle, 500 sheets/ream

No Substitute

16 Bond, 24 pound

8.5 X 11' White Ream 190 no bid -               -             
Printworks Horizontal 

Perforated Paper (3 2/3 

from bottom)   

17. Bond, 20 Pound, 3 hole punch Boise Polaris $4.15/rm $415.00

8.5 X 11, 500sheets/ream

White, Extra 

Bright Ream 100 -               -             

Navigator MP

No Substitute

18. Bond, 20 Pound Boise Polaris $4.15/rm $8,234.50

8.5 X 11, 500sheets/ream

White, Extra 

Bright Ream 1500 -               -             

Navigator MP

No Substitute

19. Bond Paper 24/60 Pound no bid

8-1/2" x 11" 500 sheets/ream White Ream 1900 -               -             

Lot 4

Bond/Text/Cover Stock
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Hammermill Fore MP

Various 

Colors

No Substitute

20. Bond Paper 24/60 Pound no bid

11" x 17" 500 sheets/ream White Ream 160 -               -             

Hammermill Fore MP

Various 

Colors

No Substitute

21. Bond, 24 Pound no bid

8-1/2" x 11"  500 sheets/ream Recycled Ream 15 -               -             

Classic Laid Imaging Natural

No Substitute White

22. Bond, 24 Pound no bid

8-1/2" x 11"  500 sheets/ream Recycled Ream 40 -               -             

Classic Linen Natural

No Substitute White

23. Bond, 24 Pound no bid -               

8-1/2" x 11"  500 sheets/ream  Ream 15 -               -             

Classic Linen Write  Avalanche

No Substitute White

24. Cover, 80 Pound no bid

8-1/2" x 11" 250 sheets/ream Ream 10 -               -             

Classic Laid Ivory

25. Text, 80 Pound Blazer Satin $14.85/rm $1,113.75

12 X 18" 500 sheets/Ream White Ream 75 -               -             

Everyday Digital Text Silk

No Substitute

26. Text, 80 Pound no bid

8.5 X 11" 500 sheets/Ream White Ream 40 -               -             

Everyday Digital Text Gloss
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No Substitute

27. Text, 80 Pound Blazer Gloss $16.37/rm $196.44

12 X 18" 500 sheets/Ream White Ream 12 -               -             

Everyday Digital Text Gloss

No Substitute

28. Text, 80 Pound Blazer Gloss $14.45/rm $635.80

11 X 17" 500 sheets/ream White Ream 44 -               -             

Everyday Digital Text Gloss

No Substitute

29.

Mohawk Colorcopy Gloss, 

32 pound no bid

11 X 17" 500 sheets/ream White Ream 24 -               -             

30. Husky Offset, 70 pound White Ream 32 -               Williamsburg $6.35/rm $203.20

8.5 X 11, 500 sheets/ream

31. Cover, 80 Pound

 11 X 17 ', 500 sheets/case White Case 6 -               -             

Everyday Digital Cover Silk 

No Substitute

32. Cover, 80 Pound 750 shts Blazer Satin $40.80/cs $163.20

12 X 18", 500 sheets/case White Case 4 -               -             

Everyday Digital Cover Silk 

No Substitute

33. Cover, 100 Pound

 12 X 18" 500 sheets/case White Case 100 $42.00/cs $4,200.00 -             

Tango/Carolina Cover CS1 HP Digital

No Substitute

34. Cover, 100 Pound

12 X 18"  500 sheets/case White Case 80 $66.70/cs $5,336.00 -             

Tango/Carolina Cover CS2 HP Digital

No Substitute
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35.

8-1/2" x 11" 2-Part, C/W, 

5000 sheets/case Case 70 $150.00/cs $10,500.00 -             

36.

8-1/2" x 11.5" 2-Part, C/W, 

5000 sheets/case Case 2 -               -             

37.

8-1/2" x 11" 2-Part, P/W, 

5000 sheets/case Case 10 $150.00/cs $1,500.00 -             

38. 

11 X 17" 2-Part, C/W, 5000 

sheets/case Case 70 $155.00/cs $10,850.00 -             

39

8-1/2" x 11" 2-Part, Pink CF, 

White CB, 5000 sheets/case Case 15 $150.00/cs $2,250 -             

40

8.5 x 11" 3-Part, PCW, 5000 

sheets/case Case 30 $178.00/cs $5,340.00 -             

41

11 X 17" 3-Part, P/C/W, 

5000 sheets/case Case 4 $178.00/cs $$712.00 -             

42

8.5 X 11" 4-Part, G/P/C/W, 

5010 sheets/case Case 8 190.00/cs $1,520.00 -             

43

8-1/2" x 11" 4-Part, 

Goldenrod CF, Pink FB, 

Canary CFB, White CB, 

5000 sheets/case Case 2 $190.00/cs $760.00 -             

44

8-1/2" x 11" 5-Part, 

Goldenrod CF, Green CFB, 

Pink CFB, Canary CFB, 

White CB, 5000 sheets/case Case 2 $196.00/cs $392.00 -             

45

11" x 17" 2-Part, Canary CF, 

White CB, 2500 sheets/case Case 30 $155.00/cs $4,650 -             

Lot 5

NCR Superior Reverse Sequence Precollated
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46

11" x 17" 3-Part, Pink CF, 

Canary CFB, White CB, 

2505 sheets/case Case 25 $178.00/cs $4,450.00 -             

47

11" x 17" 4-Part, Goldenrod 

CF, Pink CFB, Canary CFB, 

White CB, 2500 sheets/case Case 130 $188.00/cs $24,440 -             

48 8.5 X 11" CF Blue, 20 pound Ream 53 -               -             

49

8-1/2" x 11" 3-Part, W/C/P, 

5000 sheets/case Case 20 -               -             

50

8-1/2" x 11.5" 3-Part, 

W/C/P, 5000 sheets/case Case 2 -               -             

51

11 X 17" 3-Part W/C/P, 

5000 sheets/case Case 32 -               -             

52

8-1/2" x 11" 4-Part, 

W/C/P/G, 5000 sheets/case Case 4 -               -             

53

8.5 X 11" CF, Canary, 5000 

sheets/case Case 2 -               -             

54 8.5 X 11" CFB, White Case 1 -               -             
5000 sheets/case

55 8.5 X 11" CFB, Pink Case 1 -               -             
5000 sheets/case

56.

#10-24#  Regular Diagonal 

Seam (Digital), Hard Box, 

2500/case White Case 200 no bid -               -             

Lot 6

NCR Superior Straight Sequence Precollated

Lot 7

Envelopes
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57.

#10-24# Window Diagonal 

Seam (Poly Window Digital), 

Hard Box, 2500/case White Case 200 no bid -               -             

58.

#9-24 Regular Diagonal 

Seam (Digital), Hard Box, 

2500/case White Case 100 no bid -               -             

59.

#9-28# Regular Diagonal 

Seam (Digital), Hard Box, 

2500/case Manila Case 80 no bid -               -             

60.

#10-24 pound, Classic 

Linen, 2500/case

Avalanche 

White Case 2                   -                   -   

61.

A-2, 70 pound, Classic 

Crest, 2500/case

Natural 

White Case 1  no bid                   -                   -   

62. 

Catalog, Open End, Non-

Clasp Various Sizes, Variety 

of Quantity per case per size Manila Case 40 no bid -               -             

63

9.5 X 12.5" 

Dependable/Reliance 

Catalog Envelope, 28 

pound, 2500/case White Case 10 no bid -               -             
No Substitutes

64. 6 X 9" Catalog Envelope Manilla Case 2 no bid -               -             
2500/case

65

9.5 X 12 5/8" Reliance 

Booklet Envelope, 28 

pound, 2500/case White Case 2 no bid #VALUE! -             
No Substitutes

66.

#6-3/4 - 24 pound  Reliance 

Envelope (Digital) 

2500/case White 6 no bid #VALUE! -             

Page 8  Firm Name ____________________________________________________



Attachment "A"

Bid Schedule for Washoe County Requirements

Washoe County 

Bid No. 3078-19  

Bid 

Item 

No. Description Color

Product 

#

Unit of 

Purchase

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity  Unit Price  

 Extended 

Total 

 Unit 

Price  

Alternative 

offering  Unit Price 

 Extended 

Total 

67

#10 Inland Envelope, 24 

pound, 2500/case Cream Case 4 no bid #VALUE! -             

68 Printmaster Coin Envelope Manilla Case 2 no bid #VALUE! -             
28 pound, 2500/case

69

Catalog Envelope, 28 

pound, 9 X 12 with black 

inside tint 2500/case White Case 1 no bid #VALUE! -             

70 #6-3/4 Reliance Envelope  no bid
24 pound, 2500/case Blue Case 2 -               -             

71 #10 Hammermill Fore no bid
24 pound, 2500/case Blue Case 1 -               -             
No Substitutes

* Note: All window envelopes must be heat resistent 

72.

Business Card Boxes, 4.25 

X 3.75 X 2", 100 bx/case case 15 -               -             

73

Shrink Film Polvolefin 16 X 

3500/roll Clear Roll 2 no bid #VALUE! -             

74

9 X 11.5" Docutabs Die-cut 

SF Blank, 1/5 cut, 250/box white/color Box 30 no bid #VALUE! -             

76

12 X 18" Mohawk  Synthetic 

Perform Poly, Ream/100 White Ream 3 no bid #VALUE! -             

Miscellaneous

Lot 8
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77

12 X 18" Mohawk  PS Vinyl 

Perminent, Ream/100 White Ream 3 no bid #VALUE! -             

78 26 X 38" Chipboard Bundle 3 no bid #VALUE! -             
80 pound, 90/bundle

79 8.5 X 11" Clear Vinyl Cover Clear Reem 2 no bid #VALUE! -             
Pressline, 10 ml

80 8.5 X 11" Composition Black Reem 2 no bid #VALUE! -             
Pressline, Cover

81 8.5 X 11" 

Various 

Colors Reem 40 -               Showcase -             
60 pound,Starliner Crack 

and Peel 

Delivery Address:  

Washoe County Repro

1001 E. 9th Street, 

Bldg C, Room C-145

Reno, NV 89512

* Must include delivery within 24 hours

Please indicate any additional discount that would apply to combined orders that reach a certain minimum order quantity and provide a discount structure 

based on order quantity.
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